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43546 - 20/21 - 
MODIFICATIONS 

HUMAN SERVICES 
-- DSS $405,671 $925,671 

The Contractor shall provide the following 
parallel services during the term of this 
contract: A) SafeMeasures; B) Structured 
Decision Making; C) Ad Hoc Analytics; 
and D) On-Site training and coaching to 
FCS staff, supervisors and managers. A. 
SafeMeasures: The California Department 
of Social Services provides the Contractor 
with bi-weekly extracts from the statewide 
child welfare database. The Contractor 
conducts an analysis to display the data in 
tables that are related to the Division 31 
Requirements that regulate child welfare 
operations. The Contractor organizes the 
data into a user-friendly, point-and-click 
format that allows managers, supervisors, 
and child welfare workers to view data by 
program, by office site, by unit, and by 
individual. The Contractor is one of two 
entities who has access to the state’s 
database. SafeMeasures is a tool that 
supports measurement of both processes 
and outcomes. B. Structured Decision-
Making: The FCS program utilizes an 
actuarial-based safety assessment tool, 
Structured Decision-Making (SDM) to 
improve its understanding of child risk 
and to improve case decision-making. The 
Contractor manages the data generated by 

07/01/2025 06/30/2027 REGULAR 
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these assessments and produces an annual 
management report, which compiles 
information from child welfare 
assessments. SDM is a logic tool based on 
probabilities, statistics, and research on 
outcomes. C. Ad Hoc Analytics: Using 
data extracts from SafeMeasures and the 
Structured Decision-Making tools, the 
Contractor will provide, on a monthly 
basis or as requested, ongoing reports 
related to various outcome measures as 
identified in the Family and Children 
Services (FCS) System Improvement 
Plan, including disproportionality, 
differential response, standardized 
assessments, and permanency. The 
Contractor will also provide 
comprehensive quarterly reports that 
include information related to foster care 
placement patterns, with particular focus 
on racial disproportion, distance of 
placement from home, adolescents in 
placement and length of time in care, 
children in institutional care, and 
placement moves. D. On-Site training and 
coaching to FCS staff, supervisors and 
managers: The Contractor will provide 
Safety Organized Practice (SOP) to 
Domestic Violence (DV) training and 
coaching for Protective Services Workers, 
coaches and Protective Service 
Supervisors. The Contractor will also 
provide management training for 
leadership development and 
implementation of the tools. The training 
will be conducted in connection with the 
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SDM tool, to teach staff how to apply the 
material in the evidence-based decision 
making tool regarding domestic violence 
and moving it through SOP. 

44772 - 20/21 - 
MODIFICATIONS 

MUNICIPAL 
TRANSPORTATION 
AGENCY -- MTA 

$1,750,000 $11,400,000 

Selected contractors will provide 
specialized, as-needed services for the 
Sustainable Streets Division (SSD) in the 
areas of: 1.) Environmental analysis and 
documentation services (CEQA and 
NEPA); 2.) Transportation analysis and 
engineering services; 3.) Transportation 
data collection and analytics; and 4.) 
Sustainability data analysis for 
transportation projects. Work includes 
analysis of environmental strategy, 
procedures and level of required review, 
and preparing/ publishing findings when 
required by the California Environmental 
Quality Act (CEQA) and National 
Environmental Policy Act (NEPA); before 
and after studies for project 
implementation, including various modal 
movement counts; analysis and 
identification of travel markets, ridership 
patterns, modal demographics and mode 
choice, and expertise in applying 
geospatial analysis techniques to data sets; 
and drafting design standards and 
providing design recommendations. 

06/01/2024 06/30/2027 REGULAR 

46036 - 21/22 - 
MODIFICATIONS 

MUNICIPAL 
TRANSPORTATION 
AGENCY -- MTA 

$27,000,000 $387,000,000 

Provide separate professional parking 
garage operational services for 21 parking 
facilities organized into two groups as 
follows: Group A – 9 Facilities (Ellis 
O’Farrell Garage, Fifth & Mission 
Garage, Kezar Lot, Mission Bartlett 
Garage, Moscone Center Garage, 7th & 

02/01/2023 01/15/2028 REGULAR 
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Harrison Lot, Zuckerberg SF General 
Hospital Garage, 16th & Hoff Garage, 
Union Square Garage); Group B – 12 
Facilities (Japan Center Garage, Civic 
Center Garage, Golden Gateway Garage, 
Lombard Garage, North Beach Garage, 
Performing Arts Garage, Pierce Garage, 
Polk Bush Garage, Portsmouth Square 
Garage, St. Mary’s Square Garage, Sutter 
Stockton Garage, Vallejo Garage). 
Services include providing qualified and 
experienced parking personnel for parking 
operations, customer service, janitorial, 
maintenance, and security. The Operator 
shall provide oversight of all aspects of 
administrative functions including, but not 
limited to, collection, reconciliation, and 
deposit of all parking and non-parking 
revenue; repair and maintenance of 
facilities and revenue control equipment; 
compliance with insurance and bond 
requirements; providing valet or valet-
assist parking services, as needed, during 
special events. The term is for just under 
five years, thereafter on a month-to-month 
basis, not to exceed 48 months. The 
amount of $200 million represents the 
total operating expenses projected at all 21 
garages over the nearly five-year period 
starting on February 1, 2023, and ending 
on January 15, 2028. 
 
Scope Change: 
Addition of one new parking facility 
(Music Concourse Garage) to the Group B 
garage-management contract. 
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47099 - 20/21 - 
MODIFICATIONS 

MUNICIPAL 
TRANSPORTATION 
AGENCY -- MTA 

$2,268,750 $14,312,500 

Selected contractors will provide 
specialized, as-needed services to engage 
the public on transportation projects. This 
will include services such as, designing 
strategies and approaches that enable 
diverse, culturally competent public 
participation, arranging public events and 
meetings, facilitating focus groups, and 
compiling noes and records for follow-up 
and documentation; while conforming to 
The San Francisco Municipal 
Transportation Agency’s (SFMTA) 
established standards for conducting 
public outreach and engagement on its 
capital projects and programs. 

06/01/2024 06/30/2027 REGULAR 

41908 - 23/24 - 
MODIFICATIONS PORT -- PRT $11,000,000 $23,000,000 

Conceptual engineering and design for 4 
different contracts for specific locations 
along the waterfront. 

10/01/2024 09/30/2031 REGULAR 

45683 - 19/20 - 
MODIFICATIONS 

GENERAL 
SERVICES 
AGENCY - PUBLIC 
WORKS -- DPW 

$578,000 $4,771,000 

Provide technical assistance on how to 
structure a Public Private Partnership (P3) 
project, which involves the joint 
development of a public asset (building) 
and private asset (private development), 
all performed under one Developer 
Agreement. This will include advising on 
the procurement strategy, assisting with 
terms of the Development Agreement, 
Exclusive Negotiating Agreements, and 
the long-term lease. Will integrate all 
financial and legal aspects of the 
Development Agreement into the 
technical and commercial terms of the 
construction and maintenance support 
services of the public and private assets. 

05/02/2024 06/30/2026 REGULAR 
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32406 - 18/19 - 
MODIFICATIONS 

TREASURER/TAX 
COLLECTOR -- 
TTX 

$0 $500,000 

The Office of the Treasurer & Tax 
Collector requires fiscal sponsor services 
to facilitate grant fundraising for its Office 
of Financial Empowerment (OFE) and 
Financial Justice Project (FJP). The OFE 
and FJP receive private grants to fulfil 
their respective missions. OFE’s mission 
is to leverage the power of City Hall to 
strengthen the economic security and 
mobility of low income families. FJP’s 
mission is to assess and reform how fees 
and fines impact the City's most 
vulnerable residents. The role of the fiscal 
sponsor, as an independent nonprofit 
organization, is primarily to receive funds 
from philanthropic sources on behalf of 
OFE and FJP and secondarily to disburse 
funds on behalf of OFE and FJP on a case-
by-case basis. Funds received are from 
philanthropic sources that are unwilling or 
unable to provide donations directly to the 
City but are able to make donations to a 
non-profit fiscal sponsor on behalf of OFE 
and FJP. 

05/09/2024 06/30/2027 REGULAR 

' 
TOTAL AMOUNT $43,002,421 
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